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Teacher Professional Development Program Using technology-enabled and 

student-cantered learning systems 

KSCSTE, in association with HBCSE -TIFR, Department of Physics, CUSAT and Department of 
Physics, WMO Arts and Science College Muttil,  organized  a teacher training program 0n 
18/11/21  and 19/11/21 (2 days) on mathematical modelling. 20 faculties participated. 

The 2-day training facilitated the use of computational models in physics teaching and 
learning. The program focused on physics derivations, and is open to physics faculty 
members who teach undergraduate level courses in colleges and university departments 
across Kerala. 

 

The workshops will support the use of technology in teaching and learning, which allows the 
transition to interdisciplinary science practice. This transition is one of the key objectives of 
National Education Policy 2020 
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Background  

Contemporary science practice is based on computational modelling, and building of such 
models is central to interdisciplinary science and technology research. However, most 
science teaching and learning is not based on computational models. One way to introduce 
computational modelling to science classrooms is through new digital media 
representations. This is a global trend, closely connected to the teaching and learning of 
computational thinking and computational modelling. The proposed training program will 
illustrate how new digital media representations could be used to teach existing physics 
content in new ways. This would allow students to transition to computational modelling. 
The workshop will thus help build capacity in this educational innovation in India. The 
training program will be spearheaded by a team of faculty members, from Homi  Bhabha 
Centre for Science Education (HBCSE), TIFR, and Cochin University of Science and 
Technology (CUSAT). HBCSE is a National Centre of the Tata Institute of Fundamental 
Research (TIFR), Mumbai, with a dedicated research group focusing on building new digital 
media representations for teaching and learning science and mathematical modelling 

Program Schedule 
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Attendance Sheets: 
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Brochures and Photos 
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